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Rickettsial diseases have affected humanity since the dawn of civilization. Despite the advent of effective
antibiotic therapy, humans continue to be afflicted by rickettsial diseases, which still often go undiagnosed
because of their protean clinical manifestations.

During the past decade, several major developments have occurred in rickettsiology. With the advent of the
newly emerging infections caused by a number of rickettsias, the re-emerging of old pathogenic species of
rickettsias that cause both old and new syndromes has helped redefine the level of rickettsial pathogenicity.
The intracellular nature of most rickettsias remains a mystery although their genome size is close to that of
the free-living neisserias.

Advances in molecular techniques have also helped redefine and reclassify rickettsias by maintaining some
in the order Rickettsiales and placing others in other bacterial orders. The latter are still included in
rickettsial reviews because of historical precedence. These molecular advances also help us to refine our
knowledge of rickettsial pathogenesis.

This volume is the first of two volumes to result from the 4th International Conference on Rickettsiae and
Rickettsial Diseases, in which an effort is made to address and clarify issues from clinical, diagnostic,
epidemiologic, and molecular perspectives that have remained unsolved in the past. In this volume, several
subdisciplines of rickettsiology are included: genomics and proteomics, a protocol for naming newly isolated
rickettsiae; bioterrorism; the pathobiology of reckettsial infections including Q (query) fever, antibiotic
resistance, and vaccines; the discovery of new ricketsiae; and the pathobiology of Ehrlichia and Anaplasma
infections. This volume. along with Century of Rickettsiology, which will be published in 2006 as an Annals
volume, will provide a complete picture of the world-wide range of work that is currently being carried out
in the field of rickettsiology.

NOTE: Annals volumes are available for sale as individual books or as a journal. For information on
institutional journal subscriptions, please visit www.blackwellpublishing.com/nyas.

ACADEMY MEMBERS: Please contact the New York Academy of Sciences directly to place your order
(www.nyas.org). Members of the New York Academy of Science receive full-text access to the Annals
online and discounts on print volumes. Please visit http://www.nyas.org/MemberCenter/Join.aspx for more
information about becoming a member.
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From reader reviews:

Rebecca Wheeler:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to understand everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or even goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book.
They can be reading whatever they have because their hobby is usually reading a book. How about the
person who don't like reading a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book once they found difficult
problem or maybe exercise. Well, probably you should have this Rickettsioses: From Genome to Proteome,
Pathobiology, and Rickettsiae as an International Threat, Volume 1063 (Annals of the New York Academy
of Sciences).

Helen Williams:

Inside other case, little folks like to read book Rickettsioses: From Genome to Proteome, Pathobiology, and
Rickettsiae as an International Threat, Volume 1063 (Annals of the New York Academy of Sciences). You
can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important a book
Rickettsioses: From Genome to Proteome, Pathobiology, and Rickettsiae as an International Threat, Volume
1063 (Annals of the New York Academy of Sciences). You can add knowledge and of course you can
around the world by the book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can understand everything!
From your country until finally foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple factor until wonderful
thing you could know that. In this era, we can open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-
book. You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's examine.

Colin Rousey:

Here thing why this particular Rickettsioses: From Genome to Proteome, Pathobiology, and Rickettsiae as an
International Threat, Volume 1063 (Annals of the New York Academy of Sciences) are different and reliable
to be yours. First of all reading through a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of computer
which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Rickettsioses: From Genome to Proteome, Pathobiology,
and Rickettsiae as an International Threat, Volume 1063 (Annals of the New York Academy of Sciences)
giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any e-book out there but there is no guide
that similar with Rickettsioses: From Genome to Proteome, Pathobiology, and Rickettsiae as an International
Threat, Volume 1063 (Annals of the New York Academy of Sciences). It gives you thrill reading journey, its
open up your personal eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is possibly can be
happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your way home by
train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Rickettsioses: From
Genome to Proteome, Pathobiology, and Rickettsiae as an International Threat, Volume 1063 (Annals of the
New York Academy of Sciences) in e-book can be your choice.



Jeffrey Channell:

Often the book Rickettsioses: From Genome to Proteome, Pathobiology, and Rickettsiae as an International
Threat, Volume 1063 (Annals of the New York Academy of Sciences) has a lot info on it. So when you read
this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author. The writer makes
some research before write this book. That book very easy to read you may get the point easily after
scanning this book.
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